
12 Ways to Be an Amazing Mentor 

1. Approach each mentorship differently.

While you can do your best to categorize a mentor/mentee relationship, everyone is 
unique. When you first start out, it's important to take the time to assess your own style 
and readiness, and think about what kind of commitment you can and want to make. 

Rebecca Corliss, who leads team development and culture for HubSpot's marketing 
team, recommends asking yourself and reflecting on the questions on this list that are 
relevant to you: 

o What kind of manager style do you naturally have/want?
o What expectations will you set in regards to your style and how best to work with

you?
o How will you know when your mentee is successful?
o How will you communicate what success looks like to him/her?
o What do you hope your mentee’s development looks like over the course of your

mentorship?
o How can you segment out his/her experience into phases to get to that point?
o How will you use one-on-one time?
o How will you explain your expectations for one-on-one meetings (if applicable) so

you’re on the same page?

2. Set expectations together in the very beginning.

Once you've reflected on the questions from #1, both you and your mentee will find it 
helpful to sit down and go over expectations -- especially if you're just getting to know 
each other. 

For example, let's say an alum from your alma mater sends you a cold email 
asking what it's like to work at your company. You might be wondering if they asked you 
that because they want to work for your company, or whether they're just curious about 
what a company in your industry is like. Understanding exactly where they're coming 
from is going to help drive your discussion in the direction that's helpful for both of you. 
If your company isn't hiring or you aren't comfortable helping them get a job, for 
instance, then you'll want to set those expectations early. 
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3. Take a genuine interest in your mentee as a person.

A mentor/mentee relationship is a very personal one. You can give mediocre advice 
without really knowing a person, but to stand out as an amazing mentor, you're really 
going to have to get to know your mentee on a personal level. 

You probably have some of the more career-oriented questions down: what their 
working style is, their dream job, goals for their current job, and so on and so forth. But 
what about the stuff that makes them ... them? Getting to know your mentee on a deeper 
level will help you build a strong relationship, and it'll also help you understand who they 
are as a person, their likes and dislikes, how they interact with others, and so on. 

So if your mentee tells you they had a great weekend, don't just move on with the 
program. Ask them what they did, whom they did it with, or what their relationship is like 
with those people. 

One great way to get to know someone? Become an active listener. This is easier said 
than done: It means making a conscious effort to really, truly pay attention to what your 
mentee is saying, instead of thinking about what you're going to say next. You might 
worry that you need to come up with something helpful right away, when in fact, the 
best thing you can do for your mentee is to listen closely to what they're saying, ask 
open questions to dig deeper, and act as a sounding board. 

Which brings me to my next tip ... 

4. Know when to wait before giving advice.
When you're mentoring someone, you might feel pressured to give them advice straight
away. But not all feedback is helpful feedback, and giving unhelpful -- or unwelcome --
feedback can be detrimental to your relationship. An amazing mentor knows how to
determine whether or not a situation lends itself to off-the-cuff feedback or really
thoughtful feedback.

Corliss calls this "hitting the pause button." 
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"A good mentor knows when to hit 'pause' during a conversation," she told me. "Once in 
a while, a conversation might catch us off guard. For example, maybe someone raises 
an HR issue or a serious problem with an employee. Maybe someone says something 
that makes you mad or upset. If you don't have the right information, experience or 
emotional state to react to a scenario properly, hit 'pause.' That will give you a chance to 
get more information, talk to your resources, and come back with a clear and valuable 
response." 

What might that look like in a real conversation? "Thanks for sharing this with me. I'm going 
to take some time and give this some serious thought before we continue. It's important to me 
that I'm giving you the best possible solution. Why don't we continue talking about it 
[tomorrow/next week/next time we meet]? I'll book some time." 

5. Improve your emotional intelligence.

Being emotionally intelligent is a big part of being an amazing mentor. Any time you 
become a mentor for someone, you'll find yourself getting to know their unique 
personality, their wants and needs, the experiences that have shaped them, and how 
they deal with different situations. 

The best mentors know how to unlock this information by asking the right questions, 
reading their mentee's body language, being open-minded, and even acknowledging 
and controlling their own emotions. (Read this blog post for tips on becoming more 
emotionally intelligent.) 

6. Don’t assume anything about your mentee -- ask.

It's easy to fall into stereotypes or not see a situation from another person's perspective. 
But great mentors recognize that it's their responsibility to break through common 
assumptions by asking questions and digging deeper. This is especially true if you're 
mentoring someone who's in the early stages of their career, or if the two of you are just 
getting to know each other and they aren't sure how transparent to be. 

For example, let's say you're mentoring someone who's having trouble getting through 
to their manager. Instead of launching into a story about a time you had communication 
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issues with a manager of yours, spend time asking questions that draw out the 
important details of their problem. Ask your mentee detailed questions about their 
relationship with their manager. Don't assume you understand their working style simply 
based off of the conversations you've had with them, as they probably work and 
communicate differently with their manager than they do with you. 

Only once you've gotten an honest background on a problem can you share helpful, 
relevant feedback -- without making decisions for your mentee. That's up to them. 

7. Be really forthcoming about mistakes you've made.

Being open to sharing your own mistakes and failures is one of the best gifts a mentor 
can give. Not only is it helpful information for problem-solving purposes, but it also helps 
build trust, gives them permission to share their own mistakes, and strengthens the 
relationship overall. 

"Junior people don't always feel comfortable owning up to a mistake or admitting that 
they're struggling in a certain area," says Emma Brudner, who manages HubSpot's 
Sales Blog. "If you cop to your failures and struggles, you make it okay for them to 
chime in and help them share with you." 

Leslie Ye, who writes for HubSpot's Sales Blog, agrees. She suggests reflecting on the 
problems you faced and what has tripped you up at the same point in your career that 
your mentee is in. "Hearing how someone else approached a challenge is always 
helpful for someone going through it for the first time," she says. "Even if you don't solve 
problems the same way as your mentee, it's always useful to hear multiple 
perspectives." 

8. Celebrate their achievements.

Because people often look for or call upon a mentor to help them with tough situations, 
many mentorship conversations revolve around the negative stuff. When you take the 
time to highlight and even celebrate your mentee's successes and achievements, 
you're not just balancing out the mood of those conversations -- you're also building 
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your mentee's confidence, reinforcing good behavior, and keeping them focused and 
motivated. Depending on the relationship, mentees might also be seeking approval from 
their mentors -- and acknowledging their success is a way to satisfy that psychological 
need for recognition. 

How you go about celebrating their achievements is entirely up to you. For example, if 
you're a peer mentor helping onboard a new employee, you may choose to publicly 
acknowledge them either by sharing their success with their team or even just with their 
manager.  

9. Give more than you ask for.

I believe in the principle of "what goes around, comes around." I like to think about my 
mentors who've gone out of their way to meet me for coffee, give me feedback on job 
choices, point me to resources, and so on. The best mentors I've had have selflessly 
offered their time and wisdom to me -- and I'm sure the best mentors you've had have 
done the same. Think about the impact they've had on your career, and offer the same 
to your mentees. 

"Give more than you ask for," is how Ye puts it. "Most mentees inherently have less to 
offer because they're typically younger and less experienced. It can be hard to ask for 
help if you feel like you're a burden on someone else. Giving advice or help freely -- and 
making it clear you're happy to do so -- is a huge help to easing those anxieties." 

10. Seek out classes or projects related to skills your mentee wants to
develop.

Great mentors look for situations -- and some even create situations -- where their 
mentees can get involved to learn some of the skills they've been hoping to learn. It 
doesn't matter how much or how little experience you have in your mentee's current or 
desired job or industry -- you can still give them helpful resources to succeed. 

It can be anything from connecting them with someone with experience in their dream 
job or industry, or sending them a website to a conference or class they might want to 
sign up for. Take note of the areas in which your mentee wants to grow, and always be 
looking for opportunities to point them in the right direction. 



If you work at the same company as your mentee and have some involvement in their 
experience, Corliss suggests introducing new projects to them over time as a way to 
build a strong foundation. 

"First, start with something that gives context," she says. "This could be something that 
requires research and is genuinely valuable. Then, hand off something small that you 
normally do for your intern or mentee to own, like a weekly email, or a blog post. This 
will help your mentee learn how to develop ownership over something, including how to 
execute and reach a goal on his or her own. Then, build upon that foundation." 

11. Solve for the long-term.

Work with your mentee as if you'll be their mentor forever. That mindset will make it 
easier for you to give them long-term guidance, which will help them make decisions 
that outlive their time with you. 

This is particularly important if you work at the same company as your mentee because 
it'll help them make a larger impact at your company. "Giving [them] a lot of ownership 
may leave a gap when they leave, but why limit the impact your intern can have in order 
to solver for an easier transition out?" says Corliss. "It’s better to have loved and lost, 
than to have never have loved at all. " 

12. Lead by example.

Last, but certainly not least, be a positive role model. Your mentee can learn a whole lot 
from you by simply observing how you behave. They'll pick up information about your 
"ethics, values, and standards; style, beliefs, and attitudes; methods and 
procedures," writes E. Wayne Hart for Forbes. "They are likely to follow your lead, adapt 
your approach to their own style, and build confidence through their affiliation with you. 
As a mentor, you need to be keenly aware of your own behavior." 

At the end of the day, being a great mentor takes practice and patience. The more you 
work with a given mentee, the more you'll learn a lot about them: their communication 
style, how they process feedback, how they go about pursuing their goals. At the same 
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time, you'll learn a lot about yourself: how effectively you can explain ideas in a way 
others can understand, how well you're able to control your emotions, whether you're 
able to provide a vision that motivates others, and so on. 

In the end, being a mentor will likely be as rewarding an experience for you as it will be 
for your mentees.  
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